
Lust – The Downfall of Great Men

“Keep thy heart with all diligence; for out of it are the issues of life.” Proverbs 4:23

Lust has been the downfall of great men since the beginning of time.  Only 
but a few have escaped its crippling effects. It has hit mighty men like 
David, Solomon and Samson. In our generation it has struck those in 
political office and other high respected positions and it has been one of the 
driving force behind many crimes across the United States in schools and 
other places. The bible warns us to “Keep thy heart with all diligence; for 
out of it are the issues of life” Prov. 4:23.  

WHAT THE BIBLE HAS TO SAY ABOUT LUST

"But I say to you that whoever looks at a woman to lust for her has already 
committed adultery with her in his heart. If your right eye causes you to sin, 
pluck it out and cast it from you; for it is more profitable for you that one of 
your members perish, than for your whole body to be cast into hell. And if 
your right hand causes you to sin, cut it off and cast it from you; for it is 
more profitable for you that one of your members perish, than for your 
whole body to be cast into hell." (Matthew 5:28-30) 

"Therefore do not let sin reign in your mortal body, that you should obey it 
in its lusts. And do not present your members as instruments of 
unrighteousness to sin, but present yourselves to God as being alive from the 
dead, and your members as instruments of righteousness to God. For sin 
shall not have dominion over you, for you are not under law but under grace. 
What then? Shall we sin because we are not under law but under grace? 
Certainly not! Do you not know that to whom you present yourselves slaves 
to obey, you are that one’s slaves whom you obey, whether of sin leading to 
death, or of obedience leading to righteousness? But God be thanked that 
though you were slaves of sin, yet you obeyed from the heart that form of 
doctrine to which you were delivered. And having been set free from sin, 
you became slaves of righteousness. I speak in human terms because of the 
weakness of your flesh. For just as you presented your members as slaves of 
uncleanness, and of lawlessness leading to more lawlessness, so now present 
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your members as slaves of righteousness for holiness. For when you were 
slaves of sin, you were free in regard to righteousness. What fruit did you 
have then in the things of which you are now ashamed? For the end of those 
things is death. But now having been set free from sin, and having become 
slaves of God, you have your fruit to holiness, and the end, everlasting life. 
For the wages of sin is death, but the gift of God is eternal life in Christ 
Jesus our Lord." (Romans 6:12-23) 

"Foods for the stomach and the stomach for foods, but God will destroy both 
it and them. Now the body is not for sexual immorality but for the Lord, and 
the Lord for the body." (1 Corinthians 6:13) 

"Do you not know that your bodies are members of Christ? Shall I then take 
the members of Christ and make them members of a harlot? Certainly not! 
Or do you not know that he who is joined to a harlot is one body with her? 
For “the two,” He says, “shall become one flesh.” But he who is joined to 
the Lord is one spirit with Him. Flee sexual immorality. Every sin that a man 
does is outside the body, but he who commits sexual immorality sins against 
his own body. Or do you not know that your body is the temple of the Holy 
Spirit who is in you, whom you have from God, and you are not your own? 
For you were bought at a price; therefore glorify God in your body and in 
your spirit, which are God’s." (1 Corinthians 6:15-20) 

"Therefore put to death your members which are on the earth: fornication, 
uncleanness, passion, evil desire, and covetousness, which is idolatry. 
Because of these things the wrath of God is coming upon the sons of 
disobedience, in which you yourselves once walked when you lived in 
them." (Colossians 3:5-7) 

"For this is the will of God, your sanctification: that you should abstain from 
sexual immorality; that each of you should know how to possess his own 
vessel in sanctification and honor, not in passion of lust, like the Gentiles 
who do not know God; that no one should take advantage of and defraud his 
brother in this matter, because the Lord is the avenger of all such, as we also 
forewarned you and testified. For God did not call us to uncleanness, but in 
holiness." (1 Thessalonians 4:3-7) 

"Flee also youthful lusts; but pursue righteousness, faith, love, peace with 
those who call on the Lord out of a pure heart." (2 Timothy 2:22) 
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"Marriage is honorable among all, and the bed undefiled; but fornicators and 
adulterers God will judge." (Hebrews 13:4) 

"As obedient children, not conforming yourselves to the former lusts, as in 
your ignorance; but as He who called you is holy, you also be holy in all 
your conduct, because it is written, “Be holy, for I am holy.”" (1 Peter 1:14-
16) 

HOW TO OVERCOME

1. By the Word of God

"My son, keep my words, And treasure my commands within you. Keep my 
commands and live, And my law as the apple of your eye. Bind them on 
your fingers; Write them on the tablet of your heart. Say to wisdom, “You 
are my sister,” And call understanding your nearest kin, That they may keep 
you from the immoral woman, From the seductress who flatters with her 
words." (Proverbs 7:1-5) 

"How can a young man cleanse his way? By taking heed according to Your 
word." (Psalm 119:9) 

"Your word I have hidden in my heart, That I might not sin against You." 
(Psalm 119:11) 

"Sanctify them by Your truth. Your word is truth." (John 17:17) 

"You are already clean because of the word which I have spoken to you." 
(John 15:3) 

2. By Prayer

"Who can understand his errors? Cleanse me from secret faults. Keep back 
Your servant also from presumptuous sins; Let them not have dominion over 
me. Then I shall be blameless, And I shall be innocent of great transgression. 
Let the words of my mouth and the meditation of my heart Be acceptable in 
Your sight, O Lord, my strength and my Redeemer." (Psalm 19:12-14) 

"Watch and pray, lest you enter into temptation. The spirit indeed is willing, 
but the flesh is weak.”" (Matthew 26:41) 
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3. Walking in the Spirit

"I say then: Walk in the Spirit, and you shall not fulfill the lust of the flesh. 
For the flesh lusts against the Spirit, and the Spirit against the flesh; and 
these are contrary to one another, so that you do not do the things that you 
wish. But if you are led by the Spirit, you are not under the law. Now the 
works of the flesh are evident, which are: adultery, fornication, uncleanness, 
lewdness, idolatry, sorcery, hatred, contentions, jealousies, outbursts of 
wrath, selfish ambitions, dissensions, heresies, envy, murders, drunkenness, 
revelries, and the like; of which I tell you beforehand, just as I also told you 
in time past, that those who practice such things will not inherit the kingdom 
of God. But the fruit of the Spirit is love, joy, peace, longsuffering, kindness, 
goodness, faithfulness, gentleness, self-control. Against such there is no law. 
And those who are Christ’s have crucified the flesh with its passions and 
desires. If we live in the Spirit, let us also walk in the Spirit." (Galatians 
5:16-25) 

4. Putting on Christ

"Let us walk properly, as in the day, not in revelry and drunkenness, not in 
lewdness and lust, not in strife and envy. But put on the Lord Jesus Christ, 
and make no provision for the flesh, to fulfill its lusts." (Romans 13:13-16) 

5. Christ is there for your aid

"Therefore, in all things He had to be made like His brethren, that He might 
be a merciful and faithful High Priest in things pertaining to God, to make 
propitiation for the sins of the people. For in that He Himself has suffered, 
being tempted, He is able to aid those who are tempted." (Hebrews 2:17-18) 

"Seeing then that we have a great High Priest who has passed through the 
heavens, Jesus the Son of God, let us hold fast our confession. For we do not 
have a High Priest who cannot sympathize with our weaknesses, but was in 
all points tempted as we are, yet without sin. Let us therefore come boldly to 
the throne of grace, that we may obtain mercy and find grace to help in time 
of need." (Hebrews 4:14-16) 
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JOSEPH OUR EXAMPLE

"And it came to pass after these things that his master’s wife cast longing 
eyes on Joseph, and she said, “Lie with me.” But he refused and said to his 
master’s wife, “Look, my master does not know what is with me in the 
house, and he has committed all that he has to my hand. There is no one 
greater in this house than I, nor has he kept back anything from me but you, 
because you are his wife. How then can I do this great wickedness, and sin 
against God?” So it was, as she spoke to Joseph day by day, that he did not 
heed her, to lie with her or to be with her. But it happened about this time, 
when Joseph went into the house to do his work, and none of the men of the 
house was inside, that she caught him by his garment, saying, “Lie with me.” 
But he left his garment in her hand, and fled and ran outside." (Genesis 39:7-
12) 
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